
IT’S TIME TO SERVE  

CHICAGO KIDS BETTER.  

Restaurant kids’ meals can be a healthy option.    

Restaurants play a sizable role in our 
children’s diets: 
 

 Children consume roughly 25% of their calories 
from eating out, and about 42% of children aged 
two to nine eat fast food on a given day.1 

 

 Fast-food restaurants spent $583 million on 

marketing directed to children in 2009 (the latest 
year for which data are available) according to 
the Federal Trade Commission.2 

 

Restaurants meals are far from healthy: 

 

 Approximately 96% of entrees in U.S. chain 
restaurants fail to meet basic USDA nutrition 
standards, a 2013 report found.3 
 

 In 2013, an independent study documented that 
only 11 of 4,695 possible children’s meal 
combinations in fast food chain restaurants met 
all of the established nutritional criteria for pre-
schoolers, and only 19 meals met all nutritional 
criteria for older children.3 
 

 Many restaurant kids’ meals include a sugary 
drink and a sweet dessert. The American Heart 
Association recommends children under the age 
of two have no added sugars in their diets (food 
or beverages) and children and teens have less 
than six teaspoons of added sugar a day and no 
more than eight ounces of sugary drinks per 
week.4 

 

 
 
 

 

Chicago kids deserve better:  
 
 Children eat almost twice as many calories when 

they eat a meal at a restaurant than they do when 
they eat a meal at home.5 
 

 Improving nutritional standards of restaurant 
kids’ meals can go a long way to improving 
children’s diets and cultivating healthy eating 
behaviors.6 

Childhood obesity  
is a problem in Chicago 

clocc.net/kidsmeals 
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